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Palm Bay, Florida 

SPORTS

Boys: Baseball, Basketball, Cross Country, Football,
Golf, Soccer, Swimming, Tennis, Track, Wrestling

Girls: Basketball, Cheer, Cross Country, Golf, Soccer,
Softball, Swimming, Tennis, Track, Volleyball

https://www.icesusa.org/f-1-school-search/heritage-high-school/

EXTRACURRICULAR
Chorus, Band, Musical Theater, Spoken Word Poetry,
Yearbook, Student Government Association,
Technology Student Association, Panther News
Network

Public School

SCHOOL
Heritage High School creates a school culture
promoting college and career readiness through
advanced programs and instilling pride in students to
use beyond high school years.

COMMUNITY
Palm Bay is one of Central Florida's best kept secrets,
a hidden gem rich with natural resources enjoyed by
those adventurous enough to discover all this area
provides. You will see it as you drive along the scenic
highway running along the Indian River Lagoon on
Florida's Atlantic coast. The 4-mile stretch of Palm
Bay is the gateway to the city and provides residents
with many surprises, including elegant dining, scenic
waterfront views and unique shopping experiences.

Nearest City: Orlando, Florida (120 km)
Population: 122,942
Weather:  Summers are long, hot, oppressive, wet,
and mostly cloudy and the winters are short, cool,
windy, and partly cloudy.

ATTRACTIONS
Wild Florida Airboats & Gator Park, Liberty Bell
Memorial Museum, Botanical Gardens, Andretti Thrill
Park, Pelican Island National Wildlife Refuge Kiosk

AT A GLANCE

For more information, please visit www.icesusa.org or email F1@icesusa.org


